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Use this as a weekly prayer focus as we build the future 
 

March 18 
Pray for the work crew this week.  Ask for safety as they work and for 
good weather. 
 
March 25 
Intercede this week for the Easter Egg Hunt. Pray for dry weather & that 
many people from the community will attend.  Ask that new families will 
come and be interested in enrolling their children in the child enrichment 
center.  
 
April 1 
Pray for Mark, the foreman for the construction project that he will see 
Christian love and hear the gospel during the time that he is involved in 
this project.  
 
April 8 
Praise the Lord for all that has already been accomplished and intercede 
that the construction will move forward according to schedule. Pray that 
there won’t be any problems or delays. 
 
April 15 
Lift up Kathy Stoutt this week as she makes plans for the center. Ask the 
Lord to grant her strength, health and wisdom. Pray that He will guide 
every decision she makes. 
 
April 22 
Give praise to the Father for the vision He has given us to serve our 
community. Intercede that each member of our church will respond 
positively to this project and fully support it through their prayers, giving 
and other involvement.  Petition the Father to grow us spiritually and 
mature our faith, as we see Him at work as we build this facility and 
embark on this new ministry. 
 
April 29 
Pray for parents in the community to become aware of this new center 
and to enroll their children.  Intercede that God will direct non-Christian 
families to choose to place their children in our child enrichment center. 
Pray that all the openings for children will be filled.  



Thank the Lord for the opportunities this center will provide for sharing 
the Good News with children and their families. 
 
May 6 
Next Sunday we will be asked to make a commitment as to what we will 
give financially toward the building of the childcare facility.  Spend much 
time this week asking the Father, “What should I give?” Pray that each 
of us will be obedient to the answer He gives us and to step out in faith 
and trust Him to provide the means for us to keep our commitment. 
Intercede that we will be able to quickly pay off the loan for the building. 
 
May 13 
Intercede that the children who are in enrolled in this facility will hear 
about Jesus and learn about His love for them. Pray that seeds of faith 
will be planted in their lives.  Intercede that non-believing families will be 
reached for Christ through this ministry. 
 
May  20 
Petition the Lord to guide decisions as teachers and staff are hired.  Pray 
that everyone employed will have integrity and be above reproach in all 
areas of life.  Intercede that they will show Christian love to each child 
and their families. Pray for wisdom for serving any children enrolled with 
special needs.  Ask the Father to send qualified teachers with just the 
right training and experience that will be required. 
 
May 27 
Ask God to direct our church as we consider what other services and 
ministries we can offer to assist families in our community. May our eyes 
be opened to the challenges and struggles that families are facing and 
how we can assist them as a body of believers. 
 
June 3 
Pray for spiritual protection against attacks of the enemy as the building 
proceeds and as we serve the community through the child enrichment 
center. Pray that this ministry will strengthen and encourage families. 
Intercede that parents will organize their priorities and give their 
children the time, love and attention they need each day.  Pray that God 
will be glorified through all that is done! 

 
 
 



Join us at a Building the Future Prayer Event 
 
March 11 Prayer Magnets distributed by children in worship  
 
March 18 Distribute Prayer Calendar with specific weekly requests 
 
March 25 Prayer Puzzle pieces distributed by children in worship  
 
March 31 Easter Egg Hunt – Gather at 10:30 am to pray  
 
April 8  Prayer Circle around building site after worship 
 
April 15  Prayer Breakfast at 8:45 am in gym   
      
April 22  Prayer Circle around building site after worship 
 
April 29  Prayer Breakfast at 8:45 am in gym  
 
May 9  All Church Prayer Gathering at 7:00 pm  
 
May 13 Pray over list of first names kids enrolled in Child 

Enrichment Center. 
 
Use Prayer Dots as reminders to intercede for this endeavor.  
 
Every Friday we are calling the church to fast.  
 

 
 
 
 

 
For this child I prayed, and the LORD has granted me 
my petition that I made to him.         1 Samuel 1:27  


